
Draft 1 

1 

Appendix B 

 

PROJET DE LOI 

ENTITLED 

 

The Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment) Law, 2021 

 

 THE STATES OF ALDERNEY, in pursuance of their Resolution of the 

[insert date], 2021 have approved the following provisions which, subject to the 

Sanction of Her Most Excellent Majesty in Council, shall have force of law in the 

Island of Alderney. 

 

Amendment of the 1999 Law. 

 1. (1) The Gambling (Alderney) Law, 1999
a
 is amended as follows. 

 

  (2) In paragraph (a) of section 11 (cheating to be an offence), for 

"six months" substitute "12 months". 

 

  (3) In subsection (1) of section 13 (offences and penalties), for 

"liable –" to the end, substitute "liable to a fine, or to imprisonment for a term not 

exceeding two years, or to both.". 

 

_____________________________________________________________________ 
a
  Order in Council No. XIV of 1999; as amended by No. XXVIII of 2001. There 

are other amendments not relevant to this enactment. 



Draft 1 

2 

  (4) In paragraph 11(5) of Schedule 1, for "three months" substitute 

"12 months". 

 

 

Citation. 

 2. This Law may be cited as the Gambling (Alderney) (Amendment) 

Law, 2021. 

 

Commencement. 

 3. This Law shall come into force on the day appointed by Ordinance of 

the States; and different dates may be appointed for different provisions and for 

different purposes. 

 


